City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division
PUBLIC BID TABULATION

Date October 3, 2024
Bid Title Fire Gear
Department/Agency Indianapolis Fire Department
Request for Bid ID RFB-15IFD-496
Buyer Emily Koschmeder
Estimated Municipal E H ier Fi
- S |m? e. umcnpa. mergency W.S. Darly & Co. 0.05|er ire
Item # Description Quantity in Services, Inc. R . Equipment Inc.
. . . Price Per Unit . .
Units Per Year Price Per Unit Price Per Unit

MSA Cairns 880 Traditional Fire

1 Helmet with ESS Innerzone 3 100-250 No bid $523.00 $523.00
goggles
Cairns 1836 Traditional Fire
2 Helmet with ESS Innerzone 3 100-250 No bid $560.00 $565.00
goggles

Thorogood Rubber Insulated . .
3 . 200-300 No bid $176.00 No bid
Felt Fire Boot — Lug Style

Black Diamond Rubber 11"

200-300 215.00 195.00 175.00
Firefighting Boots ? 2 ?
4 | Champion Authentic Cotton 9 200-500 No bid No bid No bid
Mens Shorts with Pockets
5 | Champion Authentic Cotton 3 200-500 No bid No bid No bid
Mens Shorts with Pockets
Streamlight Rechargeabl
reamlignt Rechargeable 100-200 $96.00 $101.00 $104.00

Survivor Flashlight Orange Color




City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division
PUBLIC BID TABULATION

Estimated Municipal Emergency Hoosier Fire
.. o . W.S. Darly & Co. .
Item # Description Quantity in Services, Inc. Price Per Unit Equipment Inc.
Units Per Year Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
St light Survi Batt PK
6 reamilght survivor Sattery 100-200 $40.00 $40.00 $42.00
Div 2.
Streamlight Survivor Flashlight,
7 Rechargeable, Orange, with IFD 100-200 $138.00 $145.00 $147.00
Stamp
Streamlight Survivor Flashlight
8 100-200 $28.00 $28.00 $29.00
Battery
St light Survivor Flashlight -
9 reamilght SUTVIvor Fashiig 100-200 $352.00 $371.00 $360.00

3 Bank Battery Charger

HELMET REPAIR MATERIALS/REPLACEMENT PARTS

10 |Honeywell - Eagle 25-75 $70.00 $65.00 No bid
11  |Honeywell - Rim Edge 25-75 $40.00 $38.00 No bid
12 |Honeywell - Padding 25-75 $26.00 No bid No bid
13 Honeywell - Shield Holder 25-75 $14.00 No bid No bid
14 |Honeywell - Neck Guard 25-75 $39.00 No bid No bid
15 |Bullard - Eagle 25-75 $112.00 $83.00 $79.00
16 |Bullard - Rim Edge 25-75 $36.00 $27.00 $32.00
17 |Bullard - Padding 25-75 $22.00 $14.00 $20.00

18 |Bullard - Neck Guard 25-75 $49.00 $37.00 $40.00




City of Indianapolis/Marion County
Purchasing Division
PUBLIC BID TABULATION

Estimated Municipal Emergency W.S. Darly & Co Hoosier Fire

Item # Description Quantity in Services, Inc. . ] Equipment Inc.
. . . Price Per Unit . i
Units Per Year Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
Cairns Chinstrap A bly, 2-
19 |-A!rneLhinstrap Assembly 25 No bid No bid $90.00
pt,Pkgd
Soft Goods Kit: Cai 880
g0 [POMPoods Rt Raimns 25 No bid No bid $115.00
Helmets
Soft Goods Kit: Cai 1044
g1 [POMPO0Ods Rt Ralns 25 No bid No bid $90.00
Helmets
22 |Soft Goods Kit: Cairns 1836 25 No bid No bid $125.00
23 |Cairns Front Holder Kit 25 No bid No bid $83.00
24  |ESS Innerzone 3 Goggle Part 25 No bid $48.00 $93.00

Bullard Nomex Chinstrap
25 |w/quick release buckle & 25 $55.00 $41.00 $42.00
postman slide

26 |Bullard Brass Eagle 25 $112.00 $83.00 $79.00

27 |Bullard Cares Kit 25 $50.00 $42.00 $45.00




